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Log In as Guest User
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gl‘:_')l 28 http:/,.veproc.bokarosteel.sailbsl.in/irJ:'p*tal P~ X |I 2 Bokaro Steel Plant eProcure... * l=| o é§§
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e iRl Arw 3fvgar faftaes
STEEL AUTHORITY OF INDIA LIMITED
Elcanitein k- or
BOKARO STEEL PLANT

. 2 {

eProcurement @ Bokaro Steel Plant

SRM Sign in

mm‘ mum’ma%m UseriD* Click on ‘Guest’ to enter
formert sy

e afervam
R as Guest User
[togon ]| ouest |

Logon Problems? Get Support

FAQs
Help Desk Guest login Help
Timing: 9AM to 5:30PM IST (Monday to Saturday) Forgot Password? Help
Email : helpdesk.bokarosteel@sailbslin

Connect to SAIL Tender Website
Download Java Plug in
Download Adobe Reader

Phone: +91-6542-280319
Mobile : +91-8873002741 , +91-8873002744

There's a Littl
By Logging on this site the vendor agrees to the Terms & Conditions of eProcurement of Bokaro Steel Plant
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Viewing the List of Available RFx (Tenders)

- T [ - _— — -
e' : )I & http://eproc.bokarosteel.sailbsl.in/ir)/portal PL~CX |l & RFx and Auctions - Bokaro ... * (it e $03
n = o = - »
5% ¢ |Suggested Sites v 2 | Get more Add-ons v A v B ~ [ @ v Pagev Safety~ Tools~v (@~
06/07/2013 : 12:27:37 PM
Welcome Guest,
Help | Log Off
[ SAIL
RFx and Auctions
Overview | Public Documents
RFx and Auctions | History, Back Forward E‘<
L =
, =]
Active Queries =
eRFxs All (84) Ended (0) Completed (Refresh is running
eAuctions All(84) Published (0) Ended(0) Completed (Refresh is running)
€RFxs - Published
| Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance Change Query Define New Query Personalize
Event Number: & [ To =
Event Status: Click on RFx Number to
MyResponsesFrom: | [¥] .
_ o view Tender Document
Smart Number:
V'ev] Apply Query Changes i| Expo 5y Event Display Response Print Preview Refresh Fiter Settings
ER Event Number Event Type Event Status Start Date End Date Resp Numb Resp Status Event Version Response Version Q&A (=]
3000000255 Septum Valve Open Tender Published 08.08.2013 No Bid Created 1 0 D
8000000253 Ferro Boron Open Tender Published 25.07.2013 No Bid Created 1 0 —
| 5000000250 TRM for Trough & Runner Casting Of BF#2 = Open Tender Published 18.07.2013 No Bid Created 0
8000000245 ADJUSTABLE MOULD ASSEMBLY Open Tender Published 09.07.2013 No Bid Created 0
7000000938 CC/OTE/742/BF/28485 DATED 05.07.2013 = Open Tender Published 22.07.2013 No Bid Created 1 0
] 70000008385 CC/OTE/742/BF/28558 DATED 05.07.2013 | Open Tender Published 22.07.2013 No Bid Created 1 0
| ‘ 7000000935 CC/OTE/742/BF/28678 DATED 05.07.2013 | Open Tender Published 23.07.2013 No Bid Created 1 0 _{a
javascript:void(0); i | M
"
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Viewing RFx (Tender) Document “RFx Information” Tab

{2 RFx - Bokaro Steel Plant eProcurement - Windows Internet Explorer provided by Bokaro Steel Plant - =ana g
| Rix | History, Back Forward =}
¥

Display RFx : 8000000255 Help

RFx Number 8000000255 Smart Number Septum Valve RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 08.08.2013 10:30:00 INDIA Remaining Time RFx Number 32 Days 21:56:30 RFx Owner C001055

RFx Version Number 1 RFx Version Type Active Version
[close | | [PrintPreview | | [Register | [ Export | [ Technical RFx | | Click on Items to navigate
[ Print Preview of Extension |
to that Tab

o o \
tems = No!es and Attachments

|/RFxPamnelers | Questions = Note and Attachments = Conditions | Table Extensions = Payment | Synopsis = User-Specified Status

Time Zone: INDIA i
Submission Deadiine: * 08082013 1030:00 Technical RFx Response Opening Date: 08.08.2013 11:30:00
H . *
Cirency’ NR Case File Number: 0049
5 Techno-Comm. Bid Options: * Hard Copy
Log in Registration Deadline Date: | 02.08.2013 ==
Price Bid Options: * Hard Copy
Log in Registration Deadline Time: | 10:30:00 T
s Bid Type: * Simple Bid
Minimum Response Validity Days: | 030
PVC Applicability: 03-Not Applicable
Consortium Allowed: NO

[Close| | [Print Preview | | [Register | [ Export | [ Technical RFx |
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Viewing RFx (Tender) Document “Items” Tab

(& RFx - Bokaro Steel Plant eProcurement - Windows Internet Explorer provided by Bokaro Steel Plant - - - . — =nnal Q
RFx | History, Back F ard =)
]

Display RFx : 8000000255

RFx Number 8000000255 Smart Number Septum Valve RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 08.08.2013 10:30:00 INDI& Remaining Time RFx Number 32 Days 21:56:30 RFx Owner C001055
RFx Version Number 1 RFx Version Type Active Version
[Close | | [Print Preview | | [ Register | [ Export | [ Technical RFx | . . ”
= _ Click on ‘Notes and Attachments
[ Print Preview of Extension |
- : \ to view that Tab
RFX Information | items % Notes and Attachments
w ftem Overview
Details AddLine  AddSubine @ Cut Copy Paste Delsts Expand all Collapse All Seftings Filter Hide Outiines [
Line Number itemType  Option Type Product D Description Lot Product Category Revision Level Quantity Unit GrossPrice Currency NetValue Delivery Date Notes Aftachments Total Value Internal temh
« @iE Material 71450006710003 \ALVE SEPTUMDWN:157 100-2A [ | SM345200 2 SET INR 0.00 31.12.2013 2 0 1
[Close | | [PrintPreview | | [Register | [ Export | [ Technical RFx |
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Viewing RFx (Tender) Document “Notes and Attachments” Tab

(& RFx - Bokaro Steel Plant eProcurement - Windows Internet Explorer provided by Bokaro Steel Plant ’ . . — =) -
RFx | History,
L
Display RFx : 8000000255 Help

RFx Number 2000000255 Smart Number Septum Valve RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 08.08.2013 10:30:00 INDI& Remaining Time RFx Number 32 Days 21:56:30 RFx Owner C001055
RFx Version Number 1 RFx Version Type Active Version
[close | | [Print Preview | | [ Register | [ Export | [ Technical RFx
[ Print Preview of Extension |
RFX Information | Htems
w Notes |f|
Add Clear Fiter Settings
Assigned To Category Text Preview
Document Header Eligibility Criteria Eligibility criteria for GTE of Septum valve
tem01"VALVE SEPTUM DWN:157 100-2A" Tendering text for ltem VALVE SEPTUM DWN:157 100-2A
THROTTLE GROUP OF VALVES WIT...
ttemG1"VALVE SEPTUM DWN:157 100-2A" Name of Work Approved By : USC000648 on : 21 /09 /2010
Approved By ...
w Attachments =]
Add Aft Create Qualification Profile Fiter Settings
Assigned To Category Description File Name Version Processor Checked Out Type Size (KB) Changed By Changed On
Document Header Standard Attachment RFQ for Septum Valve FILEOOO1 1 ] doc 271 C001055 05.07.2013
'w Collaboration E]
Create Assign Deiste
Collaboration Created on

E] No collaboration has yet been created

[ Close | | [ Print Preview |

[ Register | [ Export | [ Technical RFx |
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Vendors cannot register for a bid from guest login. If you have a valid login in Bokaro Steel Plant e-tender site then
use that login to register / create bid. If you do not already have a login id please read next page.

& RFx - Bokaro Steel Plant eProcurement - Windows Internet Explorer provided by Bokaro Steel Plant Ve ~N =1
N Do NOT click “Register” as the e
Display RFx : 8000000255 error shown below will appear
RFx Number 8000000255 Smart Number Septum Valve REXS — RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 08.08.2012 10:30:00 (NDi& Remaining Time RFx Number 3Z Days 21:56:30 RFx Owner C001055
RFx Version Number 1 RFx Version Type Actiys

lose rt || Technical RF
Brink Pr  Action could notbe performed = E3
No data found for contact person
‘0000008636". Inform system
RFX Information ftems Notes and Attachments administration
w Note —
Category
Document Header .

Eligibiity

ftem01"VALVE SEPTUM DWN:157 100-24

w Attachmenis

Version Processor Checked Cut ype Size (KB)

Document Header Standard Attachment!

w Collaboration

Creaied on
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Download document (mandate form) for New Vendors :
: s Sntill o

m_ l| & http://eproc.bokarosteel.sailbsl.in/irj/portal P~ X ” & Bokaro Steel Plant eProcure... % P ke TF
5% 2 Suggested Sites v 2| Get more Add-ons ¥ & v B v [ @ v Pagev Safetyv Toolsv (@~ ?
Wier M@ 3w sfvzar s
STEEL AUTHORITY OF INDIA LIMITED
Elcangecn ke or

BOKARO STEEL PLANT

= i )

eProcurement @ Bokaro Steel Plant

SRM Sign in

userb* |
Password *
et |

Logon Problems? Get Support

Click on “Terms & Conditions” to
open mandate form. Read the

Help Desk o FAQs document carefully and submit
e Guest login Help
Timing: 9AM to 5:30PM IST (Monday to Saturday) % 2 . .
Email : helpdesk.bokarosteel@sailbslin . ::c;;g:et::zs;?::'e:::)r Webgs the form tO mentloned aUthorlty
Phone: +91-6542-280319 . : . . .
Mobile :  +94-8873002741 , +91-8873002744 ’ S as per instructions therein. j

There’'sa Ll

By Logging on this site the vendor agrees to m| Terms & Conditions [f eProcurement of Bokaro Steel Plant
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Viewing the Training Manuals, Standard Terms and other Public Documents:

—— - — e=nro
@ " &) http://eproc.bokarosteel.sailbsl.in/ir)/portal PL~-oX H 2 RFxand Auctions - Bokaro ... * {0} a7 ol
5% £ Suggested Sites v 2 Get more Add-ons v 3 v B v [ @ v Pagev Safetyv Toolsv @~ ”
06/07/2013 : 12:45:44 PM
Welcome Guest, {
Hel | Log Off
o A SAIL

RFx and Auctions

Overview | Public Documents

RFx and Auctions = | History, Back Forward |=H
i g
Active Queries Click on “Public Documents”
eRFxs All(g4) § Ended (0) Completed (0}

eAuctions  All(84) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0}

€eRFxs - Published

| Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance Change Query Define New Query Personalize

Event Number: < | To | =

Event Status:

My Responses From: ljﬂ

Smart Number: & |
View |(Siandard Vie Export Dispiay Event Display Responss Print Preview Refresh Fiter Settings
Event Number Event Description Event Type Event Status Start Date End Date R Numb Resp Status Event Version Response Version Q8A D
0255 Septum Valve Open Tender Published 08.08.2013 No Bid Created 1 0
0000253 Ferro Boron Open Tender Published 25.07.2013 No Bid Created 1 0 _
TRM for Trough & Runner Casting Of BF#2 = Open Tender Published 18.07.2013 No Bid Created 0
ADJUSTABLE MOULD ASSEMBLY Open Tender Published 09.07.2013 No Bid Created 0
7000000928 CC/OTE/742/BF/28485 DATED 05.07.2013 = Open Tender Published 22.07.2013 No Bid Created 1 0
CC/OTE/742/BF/28558 DATED 05.07.2013 | Open Tender Published 22.07.2013 No Bid Created 1 0
7000000835 CC/OTE/742/BF/28678 DATED 05.07.2013 | Open Tender Published 23.07.2013 No Bid Created i 0

R
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Viewing Training Documents for Vendor

= . —— - - - — - | B |
@. ’I & hitp://eproc.bokarosteel.sailbsl.in/ir/portal P~ X H 2 Public Documents - Bokaro... * oy s ool

»

5k £ Suggested Sites v 2] Get more Add-ons ¥ A v B v [0 @ v Pagev Safetyv Toolsv @~

06/07/2013 : 12:47:58 PM Q
| Log Off

= — TA SAIL

Welcome Guest,

RFx and Auctions

Overview |
Public Documents | History, Back Forward |=}
EEIL I
I Portal Favorites Ela (7 Public Documents 5]
= - lcon Name = Size Rating Annotations Modified
] Document Folder for Vendor View El 8/31/12 5:04:17 PM

fe I Training Documents for Vendors Bl L6 5/10/13 4:33:51 PM

Click on “Training Documents for Vendor”

Page 1/1
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Viewing Training Documents for Vendor
- . p——— — el

@ f|;:—) http://eproc.bokarosteel.sailbsl.in/ir/portal P~ X ” & Public Documents - Bokaro... * 0 .7 ol
= é] Suggested Sites v @Getmorel\dd-onsv (-} B = r.-jn v Page~v Safetyv Tools~ 'igﬁv ?
06/07/2013 : 12:49:33 PM
Welcome Guest,
Help | Log Off
- [ SALL

RFx and Auctions

Overview | Public Documents

Public Documents
4D .
I Portal Favorites Bi=] (3 public Docum... > Training Documents for Vendors g
- ~—— con Name = Size

Click on “Training Documents for Materials Procurement”

Rating for seeing manual for material supply contracts

D Training Documents for Materials Procurement &
D Training Documents for Services Procurement[E] 9/26/11 3:52:39 PM
Internet Browser Compatibility 3742 KB 5/10/13 4:33:51 PM
SRM Password Change ManualE 4 . “ e .
Click on “Internet Browser Compatibility” for seeing
manual for Browser Help Document
=== Page 1/1

L D) 12:49
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To view Training Manual for Single Bid
.- —dl - - e 5

~— — e
- I,_Q .
@_ ‘I;::ji http://eproc.bokarosteel.sailbsl.in/ir/portal P~ X ] & Public Documents - Bokaro... * {01 .0 cl”:"ﬁ

»

\7,;‘? é_] Suggested Sites v é] Get more Add-ons v f’-‘}f B - = t'jl} v Pagev Safety~v Toolsv v:@’v
{ ~ " ’ 06/07/2013 : 12:55:55 PM
A} { Y ) A ’ ' v v LIRS Help | Log Off
. » . - A SAIL
RFx and Auctions
Overview | Public Documents
Public Documents | History, Back Forward |=)
ELIL| _
I Portal Favorites E@ (3] public Docum... > Training Doc... > Training Documents for Materials Procurement[g]
: ~——  Icon Name = Size Rating Annotations

Click on “Vendor Training Manual - Materials —Single Bid”

srm vendor bid submission manualE]

5/11/13 11:50:00 AM

I Vendor Training Manual - Materials - Single Bid &

=|[=] Page 1/1
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Viewing the Vendor Training Manual — Materials — Single Bid (PDF document downloadable).
—— — R - — ~

|| & http://eproc.bokarosteel.sailbslin/irj/go/km/docs/ O ~ ¢ X | = Pu

5% £ Suggested Sites v 2 Get more Add-ons ¥ i v B v (2 @ v Pagev Safetyv Toolsv @~
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